

January 12, 2015

Roll-Offs & Dumpsters

Bid Response



Firm Name	Roll-Offs			Dumpster		
	20 Cubic Yard - Price per each - 2 Requested	30 Cubic Yard - Price per Each - 2 Requested	40 Cubic Yard - Price per each - 2 Requested	2 Cubic Yard - Price per Each - 2 requested	4 Cubic Yard - Price per Each - 4 Requested	8 Cubic Yard - Price per Each 10 Requested
Wastequip	\$ 3,730.00	\$ 4,040.00	\$ 4,612.00	\$ 434.00	\$ 584.00	\$ 890.00
Roll-Offs USA	\$ 3,331.00	\$ 3,708.00	\$ 4,410.00	\$ 431.00	\$ 572.00	\$ 824.00
Cascade	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 575.00	\$ 795.00	No Bid
Wastebuilt	\$ 3,750.00	\$ 3,950.00	\$ 4,350.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 890.00
Otto Environment	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 665.00	\$ 855.00	\$ 1,170.00

Firm Name	Roll-Offs			Dumpster			Total
	20 Cubic Yard - Price per total 2 Requested	30 Cubic Yard - Price per Total 2 Requested	40 Cubic Yard - Price per Total 2 Requested	2 Cubic Yard - Price per Total - 2 requested	4 Cubic Yard - Price per Total - 4 Requested	8 Cubic Yard - Price per Total - 10 Requested	
Wastequip	\$ 7,460.00	\$ 8,080.00	\$ 9,224.00	\$ 868.00	\$ 2,336.00	\$ 8,900.00	\$ 36,868.00
Roll-Offs USA **	\$ 6,662.00	\$ 7,416.00	\$ 8,820.00	\$ 862.00	\$ 2,288.00	\$ 8,240.00	\$ 34,288.00
Cascade *	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 3,180.00	No Bid	\$ 4,330.00
Wastebuilt ***	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,900.00	\$ 8,700.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 8,900.00	\$ 36,080.00
Otto Environment*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,330.00	\$ 3,420.00	\$ 11,700.00	\$ 16,450.00

* Not all items bid

** Add Freight \$1,800

*** Add HGAC Fee \$400.00