

Bid No. 10-25

Date: March 5, 2010

Sign Materials

Time 4:00 Central Time

Bid Tabulation



<i>Bidder Name</i>	<i>Comments</i>	<i>Sign Blanks</i>	<i>Red E-C Film</i>
American Traffic Safety Materials Bid A	Paper or Clear Backing	No Bid	444.00
American Traffic Safety Materials Bid B	Acrylic Content	No Bid	600.00
Osburn Associates		1.58	618.00
Rocal, Inc		1.83	756.00
Custom Products		2.22	808.00
TCI		2.24	No Bid
Hall Signs		2.26	738.56
Pathmark Traffic		2.69	650.00
TAPCO		2.75	760.00
Newman Signs		3.32	702.00
Roadrunner Traffic		3.63	822.00
Vintage Manufacturing		7.75	No Bid
Matticks Industries		9.00	No Bid
Nippon Carbide Ind		No Bid	540.00
Newman Signs		No Bid	702.00
3-M		No Bid	828.00
N-Line Mfg		3.80	No Bid
Bid Sync			
Electronic State Business Daily			
City of Huntsville Web Page			

R. Smith 3-11-10

Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)