

Bid No. 10-12		Pickup and Police Vehicle and Equipment																
Bid Tabulation		Date : 5/3/2010		Time: 02:00 p.m. CST														
Vendor Name	Compact Pickup Truck	Compact Pickup Truck Flex Fuel	3/4 Ton Trucks	3/4 Ton Trucks Flex Fuel	Police SUV	Police SUV Flex Fuel	Exterior Top Mount	Interior Rear Mount	Siren	Console	Speakers	Vault	Install	Graphics	Radar	In Car Video		
Wiesner, Huntsville, TX	\$ 16,978.11	No Bid	\$ 24,978.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		
Caldwell Country, Caldwell, TX	\$ 15,191.00	\$ 16,880.00	\$ 17,440.00	No Bid	\$ 24,986.00	\$ 24,986.00	\$ 1,895.00	\$ 450.00	Included w/Light Bar	\$ 450.00	Included w/ Light Bar	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,900.00			No Bid		
Planet Ford, Spring, TX	\$ 11,345.00	\$ 16,112.00	\$ 17,535.00	No Bid	\$ 22,721.00	\$ 22,960.00	\$ 1,895.00	\$ 450.00	Included w/Light Bar	\$ 425.00	Included w/ Light Bar	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,900.00			No Bid		
Tommy Vaughan, Houston, TX	\$ 11,099.00	No Bid	\$ 17,752.00	No Bid	\$ 21,891.00	\$ 21,891.00	\$ 1,389.00	\$ 315.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 398.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 2,128.00	\$ 760.00			No Bid		
Atkinson Toyota, Madisonville, TX	\$ 17,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		
Austin POMA, Austin, TX	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 255.00	\$ 224.00	No Bid	\$ 100.00	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		
Napa Auto, Huntsville, TX	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,222.99	\$ 259.00	\$ 279.99	\$ 274.99	\$ 99.00	\$ 2,199.99	\$ 1,500.00			No Bid		
Reliable Chevrolet,	\$ 16,618.00	No Bid	\$ 22,515.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25,047.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1,400.00			No Bid		
Philpott Motors, HGAC	\$ 13,952.78	No Bid	\$ 20,129.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23,884.59	\$ 1,695.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 299.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 199.00	\$ 1,729.00	\$ 1,250.00			No Bid		
* Safety Vision, Houston, TX	\$ -		\$ -													\$ 2,574.00		
* Decatur, Decatur, Il	\$ -		\$ -												\$ 1,995.00			
*Graphics	\$ -		\$ -											\$ 205.00				
*ICVS, radar and graphics purchased direct due to standardization requirements.	\$ -		\$ -															

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)

Date