

Bid Tabulation

Project Name: Bid NO. 22-12 Road Materials

Location: 1212 Avenue M Huntsville, TX 77340

Date: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 Time: 2:00 P.M. Central Time



Line	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	Unit Of Measure	Vulcan Constructing Materials LLC	Green Dream International LLC	Unique Paving Materials, Corp.
				Price Per Unit FOB/Delivered	Price Per Unit FOB/Delivered	Price Per Unit FOB/Delivered
1	Type B,C,D,F HMAC	10,000	Tons	\$ 72.28	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cold Mix(UPM)	50	Tons	\$ 125.28	No Bid	\$ 146.00
3	Flexible Base	500	Tons	\$ 37.20	\$ 45.93	No Bid
4	Stabilized Flexible Base (2 sack per cyd)	500	Tons	\$ 49.20	No Bid	No Bid
5	Stabilized Sand (2 sack per cyd)	500	Tons	\$ 37.20	No Bid	No Bid
6	Ice Rock (Type F Limestone)	300	Tons	\$ 45.70	No Bid	No Bid
7	5/8" Limestone Chip Rock	As Needed	Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Top Soil	As Needed	Tons/Cubic Yards	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Field Sand	As Needed	Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Concrete Washed Sand	500	Tons	\$ 37.70	\$ 54.18	No Bid
11	Ready – Mix Concrete – Less five (5) delivered	As Needed	Cubic Yards	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Ready – Mix Concrete – More five (5) delivered	As Needed	Cubic Yards	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Flowable Fill	100	Cubic Yards	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	3x5 Rip Rap	As Needed	Tons	\$ 44.70	\$ 59.40	No Bid
15	5x8 Rip Rap	As Needed	Tons	\$ 44.70	No Bid	No Bid
16	12" Rip Rap	As Needed	Tons	\$ 72.20	\$ 91.85	No Bid
17	18" Rip Rap	As Needed	Tons	\$ 73.20	\$ 88.00	No Bid
18	24" Rip Rap	As Needed	Tons	\$ 75.20	\$ 93.50	No Bid