

Bid No. 18-08

November 9, 2017

Road Materials

11:00 am Central Standard Time

Bid Response



\$Pickup/\$Delivered		Century Asphalt, Ltd	Gulf Coast	Vulcan Construction Materials LLC	Martin Marietta	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc	JLB Contracting, LLC	Service ReadyMix Concrete	Grisham Construction Co., Inc.	Martin Asphalt Company	Pavers Supply Co.
Description	Unit of measure	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price	Price per unit price
CRS-2 asphalt	Gallons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 1.8079	\$1.20/ \$1.31 5,000 gal. min	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$1.31 Delivered	No bid
Hot Mix	Tons	No bid	\$ 66.97	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$58.05/\$65.80
Cold Mix	Tons	No bid	\$ 75.00	\$96.75 -\$98.75 Range on Spec.	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$100.00 Pick-Up	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$105.34/\$113.09
Flowable Fill	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	No bid	\$95.00	No bid	No bid	\$138.00 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	**\$32.97/\$40.72
Flexible Base	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$41.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$29.95 Delivered City	No bid	\$28.06/\$35.81
Cement Stabilized Flexible Base- 2 sack	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$40.96/\$48.71
Cement Stabilized Flexible Base- 3 sack	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$43.60/\$51.35
Trap Rock	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$ 72.95	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$51.57/\$59.32
Chip Rock 3/8" - Limestone	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$31.26/\$39.01
Chip Rock 5/8" - Limestone	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$33.42/\$41.17
Top Soil	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$25.00 20CY Min.+\$40.00 Del	\$12.00 Delivered	No bid	No bid
Fill Dirt	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$18.00 20CY Min+\$40.00 Del	\$12.00 Delivered	No bid	No bid
Cement Stabilized Sand	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$30.97/\$38.72
Concrete Washed Sand	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	\$ 35.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$25.50 Delivered	No bid	\$25.43/\$33.18
Ready-Mix Concrete- Less five(5) delivered	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	No bid	\$108/CY + \$30.00 per Load	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Ready-Mix Concrete- More than five(5) delivered		No bid	No Bid	No bid	\$105/CY + \$30.00 per Load	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
5" x 8" Rip Rap	Cubic Yards	No bid	No Bid	\$ 51.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$49.50 Delivered	\$49.50 Delivered	No bid
3" x 5" Rip Rap	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$51.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$49.50 Min 20 Tons	\$49.50 Delivered	No bid
12" Rip Rap	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$58.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$52.50 Min 20 Tons	\$59.50 Delivered	No bid
18" Rip Rap	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$61.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$52.50 Min 20 Tons	\$59.50 Delivered	No bid
24" Rip Rap	Tons	No bid	No Bid	\$66.50 Delivered	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$52.50 Min 20 Tons	\$69.50 Delivered	No bid
Dry Screening	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Limestone Base	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$28.45 Delivered	\$32.50 Delivered	No bid
Plant Sweepings	Tons	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$22.69/\$30.44

** Flowable Fill - Pavers Supply will be unable to make delivery, does not meet minimum requirements.

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials