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Reliable
Randall Chevy -
Reed Caldwell State of Travis
Caldwell Prestige Wiesner Country Philpott Texas Trailer &
Country |J/K Chevrolet Ford Huntsville Ford Motors Contract East Mfy. Body
tem Low
# Description Budget | Quantity | Respond Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each
111/2 Ton Pick-up - Extended Cab $ 16,000.00 1 Ford F 150 | $ 15,859.00 $22,466.75 ( § 19,698.00) $ 22,395.34 | ¢ Ho»um».oo $19,992.00 | $ 20,888.00 No Bid _ No mi
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2{3/4 Ton Pick-up - Regular Cab $ 22,500.00 1 Ford F 250 ['$ 21,469.00 $24,570.86 | $ 21,850.00 | $ 23,159.02 | $ 21,587.00 | $ 22,248.00 | § 23,024.00 No Bid No Bid

Option for mud grip tires 1 125. Included |$ 15000]$ 170.00 $  107.00 No Bid $ 176.00 No Bid No Bid

Optien for extended cab 1 $ 2,027.00 s 2,003.91 1S 1,980,00 | ¢ 1,908.00 | $ 23,614.00  $ 2,548.00 | N.ONm.oo No Bid No En

3(3/4 Ton Pick-up - Extended Cab $ 21,000.00 1 Ford F 250 | $ 20,803.00 $24,784.28 fs 20,150.00 §$ 22,953.83 $20,916.00 | $ 24,348.00 { $ 21,910.88 No Bid No Bid

Option for cruise controf 1 $  200.00 included 235, Included IS  20000fs 22400 tncluded No Bid No Bid

Option for full size 4 door cab 1 $ 1,284.00 | $ 1,590.10 | $ 2,350.00 $ 1,885.00] 3 22,200.00 | $ 1,648.00 | § 1,824.00 No Bid No Bid
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4]1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Dual Wheels $ 30,000.00 1 Ford F 350 | $ 23,864.00 $26274.19 | s 24,450.00 | $ 26,163.85 $ 23,989. $24,27800] % 25,464.32 No Bid No Bid

Option for service bed installed 1 RKIT56DW941 § 7,495.00 $ 7,885.00|$ 6,535.00 | $ 9,626.00 S 6,995. S 7,800.00 | $ 6,635.00 No Bid No Bid

5]3/4 Ton Cargo Van $ 21,000.00 1 Ford E $21,652.00 | ¢ 24,252.99 | $ 20,150.00 $ 23,467.82 20,009.00°\$ 19,948.00 | $ 21,307.80 No Bid No Bid

Option for rear backing alert 1 $ 29500]s 8500138 21000[% 460008 54600 |  198.00 $ 42500 No Bid No Bid

Option for add. Interior lightin, 1 $ 85.00 No Bid $ 150005 72.25 52. $ 329.00]$ 33000 No Bid No Bid
6|Live Floor Trailer $ 60,000.00 1 East Mfg. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 61,375.00f] $ 60,525.00

Less trade-in 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 14,000.00 10,000.

7]Compact Tractor w/ Cab $ 18,650.00 1 Kubota No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60" finish mower 1 Lands Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60" shredder/pasture mower 1 Lands Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PTO powered leaf blower 1 ri Metal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8|Zero Turn Mowers $ 11,000.00 4 Kubota No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Option with 30hp equal or better 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Option overhead canopy 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Option side discharge 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9|Special Utility Vehicle $ 9,000.00 1 Kubota No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid _
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*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

Southern Tractor late bid received
Wastequip submitted a formal no bid
Item 1 A - Caldwell County - bid requested extended cab long bed. Bid is for regular cab short bed
Item 1 C- Budget $16,000 low responder $19,698 price overage = $3,698.00
Item 2 - Bid specifications has language to consider options for mud grip tires and extended cab.
Item 2 A - Budget $22,500 low responder with mud grip tires $21,594 price under = $906.00
Item 3 - Bid specifications has language to consider options for cruise control and full size 4 door cab
Item 3C- Budget $21,000 low responder with cruise controf $ 20,385 price under = $615.00
Item 4 - Bid specifications allow for service bed to be installed turn key additionally service bed is listed separately to gain best value for City
Item 4 E - Budget $30,000 low responder turnkey $30,984.00 overage = $984.00
Item 5 - Fleet replacement schedule approved a change from a pick-up truck to a cargo panel van,
Bid specifications written as a cargo van with option for rear alarm and additional inteior ghting.
Item 5 C -Randall Reed rear backing alert system does not include interior in dash alert system
Item 5 E - Budget $20,009 low responder with rear alarm with interior dash alert system and additional lighting $ 20,607 price under =
Item 6 - Bid Specifications include option for trade - in
ltem 6 H - Budget $60,000 low responder $60,525 overage $525.00
Item 7 - Bid specifications include listing of various implements with St. Department fund 323 earmarked for implements
tem 7 - Best value to purchase tractor and implements seperately
tem 7 L - Budget $11,500 low responder $17,600 price overage = $6,100
tem 7 K- Budget $ 7,150 low responder for all implements $6,900 price under = $250.00
tem 8 - Budget $11,000 each 4 units prefered brand Peters Tractor $11,100 price overage = $400.00
tem 8 O - Luber Brothers -bid requested diesel engine. Bid is for gasoline engine - diesel engine not available
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Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)

$393.

O Circle notes award

00



ITEM J K L M N [¢]
Huntsville Truck &
Coufal Prater Tractor Peters Tractor Professional Turf Moridge Mfg. Luber Brothers
Item Low
# Description Budget Quantity | Respond Each Total Each Total Each Total Total Each Total Each Total
111/2 Ton Pick-up - Extended Cab $ 16,000.00 1 Ford F 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2/3/4 Ton Pick-up - Regular Cab $ 22,500.00 1 Ford F 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for mud grip tires 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for extended cab 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
z . el = T
3|3/4 Ton Pick-up - Extended Cab $ 21,000.00 1 Ford F 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for cruise control 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for full size 4 door cab 1 No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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4|1 Ton Crew Cab w/ Dual Wheels 1 Ford F 350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for service bed installed 1 RKIT56DW94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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5|3/4 Ton Cargo Van $ 21,000.00 1 Ford E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for rear backing alert 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option for add. Interior lightin, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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6[Live Floor Trailer $ 60,000.00 1 No Bid No 8Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Less trade-in 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7{Compact Tractor w/ Cab $ 18,650.00 1 Kubota $23,764.00 | $23,764.00 | $ 18,219.00 | $ 18.219.00 | $ 17,600.00 ($ 17,600. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" finish mower 1 Lands Pride | $ 2,350.00 | $ 2,350.00 | $ 1,850.00 H\mmo.od: $ 1,865.00 gao No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" shredder/pasture mower 1 Lands Pride | $ 2,195.00 | $ 2,195.00]$ 1,150.00{ $ 1,150.00 {)$ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PTO powered leaf blower 1 Agri Metal | $ 3,950.00 | $ 3,950.00 | $ 3,900.00 3,900. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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8|Zero Turn Mowers 4 $14,195.00 | $ 56,780.00 | $ 11,440.00 $ 45,760.00 £$ 11,100. $ 44,400.00 | $ 13,007.04 | $ 52,028.16 | $ 10,797.00 | $ 43,188.00 | $ 9,739.00 | $ 38,956.00
Option with 30hp equal or better 4 $14,195.00 | $ 56,780.00 | $ 12,404.00 | $ 49,616.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 15,099.06 | $ 60,396.24 | $ 1,400.00 [ $ 5,600.00 | $ 10,231.20 | $ 40,924.80
Option overhead canopy 4 $14,545.00 | $58,180.00 [ $ 325.00 $ 1,30000)$ 22500]¢$ 900.00]$ 24590 $ 98360]S 270.00$ 1,08000)$ 349.00| % 1,396.00
Option side discharge 4 $ 14,025.00 | $ 56,100.00 | $ 11,435.00 | $ 45,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  (255.00)] $ {1,020.00) No Bid No Bid
9 |Special Utility Vehicle $ 9,000.00 1 Kubota $11,681.00 | $11,681.00 f $ 9,807.00 | $ 9,807.00 | $ 9,730.00 {$ 9,730.00) $ 24,275.38 | $ 24,275.38 No Bid No Bid $10,975.92 | $ 10,975.92
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*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and fc
Southern Tractor late bid received
Wastequip submitted a formal no bid
Item 1 A - Caldwell County - bid requested extended cab long bed. Bid is for regular cz
Item 1 C- Budget $16,000 low responder $19,698 price overage = $3,698.00
Item 2 - Bid specifications has language to consider options for mud grip tires and exte
Item 2 A - Budget $22,500 low responder with mud grip tires $21,594 price under = $¢
Item 3 - Bid specifications has language to consider options for cruise control and full s
item 3 C- Budget $21,000 low responder with cruise control $ 20,385 price under = $¢
Item 4 - Bid specifications allow for service bed to be installed turn key additionally ser
Item 4 E - Budget $30,000 low responder turnkey $30,984.00 overage = $984.00
item S - Fleet replacement schedule approved a change from a pick-up truck to a carge
Bid specifications written as a cargo van with option for rear alarm and addition
Item 5 C -Randall Reed rear backing alert system does not include interior in dash alert
Item 5 E - Budget $20,009 low responder with rear alarm with interior dash alert syste
Item 6 - Bid Specifications include opticn for trade - in
Item 6 H - Budget $60,000 low responder $60,525 overage $525.00
Item 7 - Bid specifications include listing of various implements with St. Department fur
Item 7 - Best value to purchase tractor and implements seperately
Item 7 L - Budget $11,500 low responder $17,600 price overage = $6,100
item 7 K- Budget $ 7,150 low responder for all impiements $6,900 price under = $250.
Item 8 - Budget $11,000 each 4 units prefered brand Peters Tractor $11,100 price over:
Item 8 O - Luber Brothers -bid requested diesel engine. Bid is for gasoline engine - dies
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e Smith {Purchasing Manager)




